
Contractor Greater Dayton 
Construction, Ltd. James Construction C.G. Egli

Base Bid

Labor $1,202,592.00  Not Provided 

Materials  $                     706,285.00 Not Provided

Permit Allowance 20,000.00$                        20,000.00$                        

Unforseen Conditions Allowance 100,000.00$                      75,000.00$                        

Total Base Bid 2,028,877.00$                   2,780,000.00$                   NO BID
Alternate Deduct #1 -  Tuckpointing  $                        (4,305.00)  Not Provided NO BID
Alternate Deduct #2 - Vinyl Siding (10,870.00)$                        $                      (12,500.00) NO BID

Alternate Deduct #3 Rubber Base
(15,189.00)$                        $                        (7,500.00) NO BID

Alternate Deduct #4 Allowance

(50,000.00)$                        $                      (50,000.00) NO BID

Total Base Bid Inclusive of Alternate Deducts  $                  1,948,513.00  $                  2,710,000.00 NO BID
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